Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, New York

Bids opened March 18, 2010 Contract period - 4/02/10 - 4/01/11

Ready Mix Concrete

[e2] o) [*2] [*2]

CLSM Sector No. 1 § Sector No. 2 § Sector No. 3 § Sector No. 4 §
Hanson Aggregates , Inc. 100 Ib. 76.00 73.00 73.00 70.00 73.00 70.00 73.00 70.00
6895 Ellicott Street 3000 Ib. 116.00 113.00 103.00 100.00 103.00 109.00 103.00 100.00
Pavilion, NY 14525 4000 Ib. 120.00 117.00 107.00 104.00 107.00 113.00 107.00 104.00
Phone: 584-3132 5000 Ib. 122.00 119.00 102.00 100.50 115.00 115.00 105.00 105.50
8000 Ib. 195.00 190.00 185.00 181.00 185.00 181.00 185.00 181.00

*Heat Charge - $8.00/cy Class A 115.00 - 105.00 - 105.00 - 105.00 -

from 11/15/10 to 4/15/11 Class J 117.00 - 107.00 - 107.00 - 107.00 -
Elam Sand & Gravel Corp. ** 100 Ib. No Bid No Bid 76.50 75.50 76.50 No Bid 76.50 No Bid
P.O. Box 65 3000 Ib. No Bid No Bid 98.50 95.50 94.00 92.50 94.00 92.50
West Bloomfield, NY 14585 4000 Ib. No Bid No Bid 101.00 99.00 99.00 96.50 99.00 96.50
Phone: 657-8001 5000 Ib. No Bid No Bid 101.00 101.00 107.00 101.00 107.00 101.00
8000 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Heat Charge - $9.00/cy Class A No Bid - 100.00 - 100.00 - 100.00 -

from 11/15/10 to 4/15/11 Class J No Bid - 103.00 - 103.00 - 103.00 -
Buffalo Crushed Stone, Inc. 100 Ib. 58.50 58.50 63.50 63.50 58.50 58.50 63.50 63.50
d/b/a Buffalo Redi-Mix 3000 Ib. 102.60 99.62 108.80 104.62 102.60 99.62 108.80 104.62
2544 Clinton Street 4000 Ib. 112.00 111.00 117.00 116.00 112.00 111.00 117.00 116.00
P.O. Box 710 5000 Ib. 115.72 112.35 120.87 117.35 115.72 112.35 120.87 117.35
Buffalo, NY 14211 8000 Ib. 185.25 181.67 190.40 186.67 185.25 181.67 190.40 186.67

Class A 108.70 113.70 - 108.70 - 113.70 -

*Heat Charge - $7.95/cy Class J 112.28 117.28 - 112.28 - 117.28 -

from 11/1/10 to 4/1/11
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Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, New York

For delivery to Wyoming County Towns as follows: Ready Mix Concrete

Sector No. 1 Bennington, Sheldon, Attica, Orangeville
Sector No. 2 Middlebury, Warsaw, Covington, Perry
Sector No. 3 Java, Arcade, Wethersfield, Eagle
Sector No. 4 Gainesville, Pike, Castile, Genesee Falls

Contract to furnish ready mix concrete awarded
to the lowest bidder in Sector No. 1, 2, 3 & 4.

Todd Gadd
County Superintendent of Highways
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