
Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, NY  14550

Crushed Stone
Bids opened - March 18, 2010 Contract period - 4/2/10-4/1/11

Corrected 5/3/10      Bid price/ton - F.O.B. plant

Crusher Crusher
1A 1st 1 2 Run 1 Run 2

Buffalo Crushed Stone, Inc.
2544 Clinton Street
Buffalo, New York  14224
Phone:   826-7310
Wherle Drive, Lancaster Plant 14.10 No Bid 13.30 11.80 No Bid No Bid

to widener addt'l $2.00
2009 13.60 No Bid 12.95 11.45 No Bid No Bid

County Line Stone Co., Inc.
4515 Crittenden Road
P.O. Box 150
Akron, New York  14001
Phone:   542-5435 11.75 11.00 9.85 9.40 8.10 7.40

to widener addt'l $3.20
2009 11.25 10.75 9.60 9.10 7.85 7.15

Dolomite Products Company, Inc
1150 Penfield Road
Rochester, New York  14625
Phone:   381-7010
Gulf Rd. Leroy Plant 10.25 9.75 9.50 9.50 6.50 6.00

to widener addt'l $10.00
2009 9.75 9.25 9.00 9.00 6.25 5.75

Hanson Aggregates GLSC, Inc.
6895 Ellicott Street
Pavilion, New York  14525
Phone   584-3132
Stafford Plant 11.50 10.25 9.50 9.50 6.50 6.00

to widener addt'l $1.00
2009 11.25 10.00 9.00 9.00 6.25 5.75

Todd Gadd
County Superintendent of Highways



Crushed Stone - Bids opened March 18, 2010                  Contract period 4/2/10 - 4/1/11

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Arcade
Size Price/Ton Supplier To Widener Supplier 2009-2010

1A 15.25 Dolomite Products 19.15 County Line Stone Dolomite 14.75
1st 14.75 Dolomite Products 18.40 County Line Stone Dolomite 14.25
1 14.35 County Line Stone 17.55 County Line Stone Dolomite 14.00
2 13.15 County Line Stone 16.35 County Line Stone County Line 13.75
Crusher Run 1 11.50 Dolomite Products 14.95 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 11.25
Crusher Run 2 11.00 Dolomite Products 14.45 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 10.75

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Attica
1A 14.70 County Line Stone 16.65 Hanson Aggregates County Line 14.20
1st 13.70 County Line Stone 15.40 Hanson Aggregates County Line 13.25
1 12.90 County Line Stone 14.65 Hanson Aggregates County Line 12.20
2 12.65 County Line Stone 14.65 Hanson Aggregates County Line 11.85
Crusher Run 1 10.55 County Line Stone 11.65 Hanson Aggregates County Line 10.25
Crusher Run 2 9.95 County Line Stone 11.15 Hanson Aggregates County Line 9.55

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Bennington
1A 15.20 County Line Stone 18.25 Hanson Aggregates County Line 14.20
1st 14.40 County Line Stone 17.00 Hanson Aggregates County Line 13.25
1 13.50 County Line Stone 16.25 Hanson Aggregates County Line 12.20
2 13.45 County Line Stone 16.25 Hanson Aggregates County Line 11.85
Crusher Run 1 11.20 County Line Stone 13.25 Hanson Aggregates County Line 10.40
Crusher Run 2 9.65 County Line Stone 12.75 Hanson Aggregates County Line 10.10

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Castile
1A 16.00 Dolomite Products 18.10 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.50
1st 15.50 Dolomite Products 16.85 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.00
1 15.10 Hanson Aggregates 16.10 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 14.60
2 15.10 Hanson Aggregates 16.10 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 11.85
Crusher Run 1 12.10 Hanson Aggregates 13.10 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 11.35
Crusher Run 2 11.60 Hanson Aggregates 12.60 Hanson Aggregates

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Covington
1A 13.75 Dolomite Products 15.80 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 13.25
1st 13.25 Dolomite Products 14.55 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 12.75
1 12.80 Hanson Aggregates 13.80 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 12.30
2 12.80 Hanson Aggregates 13.80 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 12.30
Crusher Run 1 9.80 Hanson Aggregates 10.80 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 9.55
Crusher Run 2 9.30 Hanson Aggregates 10.30 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 9.05

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Eagle
1A 17.25 County Line Stone 19.00 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 17.00
1st 16.75 Hanson Aggregates 17.75 Hanson Aggregates County Line 16.40
1 15.55 County Line Stone 17.00 Hanson Aggregates County Line 15.35
2 15.40 County Line Stone 17.00 Hanson Aggregates County Line 14.95
Crusher Run 1 13.00 Hanson Aggregates 14.00 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 12.75
Crusher Run 2 12.50 Hanson Aggregates 13.50 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 12.25



Crushed Stone - Bids opened March 18, 2010                  Contract period 4/2/10 - 4/1/11
                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Gainesville
1A 16.00 Dolomite Products 18.10 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.50
1st 15.50 Dolomite Products 16.85 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.00
1 14.90 County Line Stone 16.10 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 14.60
2 14.65 County Line Stone 16.10 Hanson Aggregates County Line 14.20
Crusher Run 1 12.10 Hanson Aggregates 13.10 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 11.85
Crusher Run 2 11.60 Hanson Aggregates 12.60 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 11.35

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Genesee Falls
1A 16.40 Dolomite Products 19.40 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.90
1st 15.90 Dolomite Products 18.15 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.40
1 15.65 Dolomite Products 17.40 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.15
2 15.65 Dolomite Products 17.40 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.15
Crusher Run 1 12.65 Dolomite Products 14.40 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 12.40
Crusher Run 2 12.15 Dolomite Products 13.90 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 11.90

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Java
1A 16.50 County Line Stone 19.05 Hanson Aggregates County Line 15.65
1st 15.95 County Line Stone 17.80 Hanson Aggregates County Line 14.85
1 15.50 County Line Stone 17.05 Hanson Aggregates County Line 13.95
2 14.85 County Line Stone 17.05 Hanson Aggregates County Line 13.65
Crusher Run 1 12.60 County Line Stone 14.05 Hanson Aggregates County Line 11.85
Crusher Run 2 12.10 County Line Stone 13.55 Hanson Aggregates County Line 11.20

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Middlebury
1A 13.75 Dolomite Products 16.50 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 13.25
1st 13.25 Dolomite Products 15.25 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 12.75
1 13.00 Dolomite Products 14.50 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 12.50
2 13.00 Dolomite Products 14.50 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 12.50
Crusher Run 1 10.00 Dolomite Products 11.50 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 9.75
Crusher Run 2 9.50 Dolomite Products 11.00 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 9.25

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Orangeville
1A 15.20 County Line Stone 17.85 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 14.75
1st 14.65 County Line Stone 16.60 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 14.25
1 14.00 County Line Stone 15.85 Hanson Aggregates County Line 13.65
2 13.95 County Line Stone 15.85 Hanson Aggregates County Line 13.40
Crusher Run 1 11.50 Dolomite Products 12.85 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 11.25
Crusher Run 2 11.00 Dolomite Products 12.35 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 10.75



Crushed Stone - Bids opened March 18, 2010                  Contract period 4/2/10 - 4/1/11
                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Perry
1A 15.25 Dolomite Products 17.25 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 14.75
1st 14.75 Dolomite Products 16.00 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 14.25
1 14.25 Hanson Aggregates 15.25 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 13.75
2 14.25 Hanson Aggregates 15.25 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 13.75
Crusher Run 1 11.25 Hanson Aggregates 12.25 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 11.00
Crusher Run 2 10.75 Hanson Aggregates 11.75 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 10.50

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Pike
1A 16.65 Dolomite Products 19.15 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 16.15
1st 16.15 Dolomite Products 17.90 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.65
1 15.90 Dolomite Products 17.15 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.40
2 15.40 County Line Stone 17.15 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.10
Crusher Run 1 12.90 Dolomite Products 14.15 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 12.65
Crusher Run 2 12.40 Dolomite Products 13.65 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 12.15

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Sheldon
1A 15.90 County Line Stone 18.00 Hanson Aggregates County Line 14.95
1st 15.30 County Line Stone 16.75 Hanson Aggregates County Line 13.95
1 14.30 County Line Stone 16.00 Hanson Aggregates County Line 13.30
2 14.20 County Line Stone 16.00 Hanson Aggregates County Line 12.80
Crusher Run 1 11.80 County Line Stone 13.00 Hanson Aggregates County Line 11.15
Crusher Run 2 11.15 County Line Stone 12.50 Hanson Aggregates County Line 10.60

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Warsaw
1A 15.25 Dolomite Products 16.90 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 14.00
1st 14.65 Hanson Aggregates 15.65 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 13.50
1 13.90 Hanson Aggregates 14.90 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 13.25
2 13.80 County Line Stone 14.90 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 13.25
Crusher Run 1 10.90 Hanson Aggregates 11.90 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 10.50
Crusher Run 2 10.40 Hanson Aggregates 11.40 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 10.00

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Wethersfield
1A 16.50 Dolomite Products 18.35 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 16.00
1st 16.00 Dolomite Products 17.10 Hanson Aggregates Dolomite 15.50
1 15.05 County Line Stone 16.35 Hanson Aggregates County Line 14.60
2 14.90 County Line Stone 16.35 Hanson Aggregates County Line 14.25
Crusher Run 1 12.35 Hanson Aggregates 13.35 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 13.10
Crusher Run 2 11.85 Hanson Aggregates 12.85 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 12.60
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