
Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, NY  14550

Crushed Gravel
Bids opened - March 18, 2010 Contract period - 4/2/10-4/1/11

     Bid price/ton - F.O.B. plant
Crusher Crusher

1A 1st 1 2 Run 1 Run 2

Attica Sand & Gravel, Inc.
P.O. Box 217
East Pembroke, NY  14056
Phone    762-8825
Plant - East Main Rd, Attica 9.85 No Bid 9.35 9.35 No Bid 7.90
to widener - no addt'l

2009 9.85 No Bid 9.35 9.35 No Bid 7.90

Buffalo Crushed Stone, Inc.
2544 Clinton Street
Buffalo, New York  14224
Phone:   826-7310
Plant - Franklinville, NY 11.00 9.50 8.85 9.05 No Bid No Bid
to widener - no addt'l

2009 10.75 9.25 8.60 8.80 No Bid No Bid

D & H Materials
11939 Route 98 South
Arcade, NY  14009
Phone: 716-492-4956
Plant - Hiram Rd., Arcade No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.75 7.75
to widener - addt'l $0.60 

2009 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dolomite Products Company, Inc
1150 Penfield Road
Rochester, New York  14625
Phone:   381-7010
Plant - Oak Opening Rd, Avon 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 6.50 6.00
to widener - addt'l $10.00

2009 8.00 No Bid 8.00 8.00 5.75 5.75

Elam Materials
P.O. Box 337
Mt. Morris, NY 14510
Plant - Jones Rd., Cohocton No Bid 12.50 12.50 12.50 13.40 13.40
to widener - no addt'l

2009 No Bid 12.75 12.75 12.75 No Bid No Bid

Frey Sand & Gravel
75 Bank Street
Orchard Park, New York  14127
Phone:   591-1515
Plant - Alexander 9.50 No Bid 9.65 9.20 No Bid 8.35
to widener - no addt'l

2009 9.30 No Bid 9.55 9.00 No Bid 8.20



Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, NY  14550

Crushed Gravel
Bids opened - March 18, 2010 Contract period - 4/2/10-4/1/11

     Bid price/ton - F.O.B. plant
Crusher Crusher

1A 1st 1 2 Run 1 Run 2
Gernatt Asphalt Products, Inc.
P.O. Box 400
Collins, New York  14034
Phone - 532-3371
Plant - Freedom 10.95 10.45 11.45 11.20 10.45 9.95
to widener - addt'l $0.50

2009 10.75 9.85 11.25 11.00 10.25 9.75

Hanson Aggregates GLSC, Inc.
6895 Ellicott Street
Pavilion, New York  14525
Phone   584-3132
Plant -Batavia & Stafford 10.00 No Bid 9.50 9.50 No Bid No Bid
to widener - addt'l $1.00

2009 9.50 No Bid 9.25 9.25 No Bid No Bid

Java Materials, Inc.
320 Crabapple Lane
Cheektowaga, New York 14227
Phone:   668-4444
Plant - Rt. 98 & 78, Java No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.25 5.85
to widener - addt'l $3.20

2009 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.25 5.85

West Wind Aggregates
6334 Lamont Rd.
Castile, NY 14427
Phone:  493-2775/cell 409-5263
Plant - Lamont Rd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.49
to widener - addt'l $1.10

2009 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.24 4.99

Todd Gadd
County Superintendent of Highways



Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, New York  14550

CRUSHED GRAVEL - Bids opened March 18, 2010                  Contract period 4/2/10 - 4/1/11

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Arcade 2009/2010
Size Price/Ton Supplier
1A 12.95 Gernatt Asphalt - Freedom Gernatt 12.75
1st 12.25 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Gernatt 11.85
1 11.60 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Gernatt 13.25
2 11.80 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 11.55
Crusher Run 1 9.25 Java Materials Java Materials 11.25
Crusher Run 2 8.85 Java Materials Java Materials 10.85

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Attica
1A 11.75 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 11.50
1st 15.00 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.75
1 11.90 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.15
2 11.45 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 11.60
Crusher Run 1 13.10 D&H Materials Dolomite 12.75
Crusher Run 2 10.35 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 10.60

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Bennington
1A 12.15 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 11.90
1st 14.85 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.60
1 12.30 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.15
2 11.85 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 11.60
Crusher Run 1 10.25 Java Materials Dolomite 12.75
Crusher Run 2 9.85 Java Materials Frey S&G 10.60

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Castile
1A 14.95 Dolomite Products Elam 14.25
1st 14.95 Dolomite Products Bflo Crushed 14.75
1 14.35 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.10
2 14.55 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Elam 14.25
Crusher Run 1 11.25 D&H Materials Java Materials 12.00
Crusher Run 2 6.79 West Wind Aggregates Java Materials 11.60

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Covington
1A 12.65 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.35
1st 13.50 Elam Materials Bflo Crushed 16.60
1 12.80 Hanson Aggregates Hanson 12.55
2 12.35 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.05
Crusher Run 1 11.50 Dolomite Products Dolomite 10.75
Crusher Run 2 11.00 Dolomite Products Dolomite 10.75

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Eagle
1A 14.95 Gernatt Asphalt - Freedom Gernatt 14.75
1st 13.50 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 13.25
1 12.85 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 12.60
2 13.05 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 12.80
Crusher Run 1 9.25 Java Materials Java Materials 9.95
Crusher Run 2 8.85 Java Materials Java Materials 9.55



Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, New York  14550

CRUSHED GRAVEL - Bids opened March 18, 2010                  Contract period 4/2/10 - 4/1/11
                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Gainesville
1A 15.50 Dolomite Products Dolomite 15.00
1st 15.00 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.75
1 14.35 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.10
2 14.55 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.30
Crusher Run 1 10.25 Java Materials Java Materials 10.65
Crusher Run 2 6.43 West Wind Aggregates Java Materials 10.25

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Genesee Falls
1A 16.05 Dolomite Products Dolomite 15.55
1st 15.35 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 15.10
1 14.70 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.45
2 14.90 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.65
Crusher Run 1 11.25 Java Materials Java Materials 12.40
Crusher Run 2 6.96 West Wind Aggregates Java Materials 12.00

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Java
1A 13.25 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 13.00
1st 13.50 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 13.25
1 12.85 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 12.60
2 12.95 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.70
Crusher Run 1 8.25 Java Materials Java Materials 9.95
Crusher Run 2 7.85 Java Materials Java Materials 9.55

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Middlebury
1A 12.40 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.10
1st 13.00 Dolomite Products Bflo Crushed 16.05.
1 12.40 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.35
2 12.00 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 11.80
Crusher Run 1 11.00 Dolomite Products Dolomite 10.25
Crusher Run 2 10.50 Dolomite Products Dolomite 10.25

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Orangeville
1A 12.60 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.30
1st 15.00 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.75
1 12.75 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.55
2 12.25 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.00
Crusher Run 1 9.25 Java Materials Java Materials 11.25
Crusher Run 2 8.85 Java Materials Java Materials 10.85



Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, New York  14550

CRUSHED GRAVEL - Bids opened March 18, 2010                  Contract period 4/2/10 - 4/1/11
                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Perry
1A 14.24 Attica Sand & Gravel Dolomite 13.75
1st 14.25 Dolomite Products Elam 14.00
1 13.74 Attica Sand & Gravel Elam 13.65
2 13.74 Attica Sand & Gravel Elam 13.65
Crusher Run 1 12.25 Dolomite Products Dolomite 11.50
Crusher Run 2 11.75 Dolomite Products Dolomite 11.50

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Pike
1A 15.25 Gernatt Asphalt - Freedom Dolomite 14.75
1st 14.35 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.10
1 13.70 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 13.45
2 13.90 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 13.65
Crusher Run 1 10.25 Java Materials Java Materials 10.85
Crusher Run 2 6.61 West Wind Aggregates Java Materials 10.45

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Sheldon
1A 12.80 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.50
1st 14.35 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Bflo Crushed 14.10
1 12.95 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.75
2 12.50 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.20
Crusher Run 1 9.25 Java Materials Java Materials 11.25
Crusher Run 2 8.85 Java Materials Java Materials 10.85

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Warsaw
1A 13.40 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 13.10
1st 14.50 Dolomite Products Bflo Crushed 15.50
1 13.45 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 13.20
2 13.10 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 12.80
Crusher Run 1 10.25 Java Materials Dolomite 11.75
Crusher Run 2 9.85 Java Materials Java Materials 11.35

                               Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Wethersfield
1A 13.65 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 13.30
1st 14.45 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Fbflo Crushed 14.20
1 13.74 Buffalo Crushed Stone - Franklinville Frey S&G 13.55
2 13.35 Frey Sand & Gravel Frey S&G 13.00
Crusher Run 1 9.25 Java Materials Java Materials 9.70
Crusher Run 2 8.85 Java Materials Java Materials 9.30
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