

Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, NY 14550

Crushed Stone

Bids opened - March 19, 2019

Contract period - 4/02/19 - 4/01/20

Bid price/ton - F.O.B. plant

	<u>1A</u>	<u>1st</u>	<u>1</u>	<u>2</u>	<u>Crusher Run 1</u>	<u>Crusher Run 2</u>
County Line Stone Co., Inc. 4515 Crittenden Road P.O. Box 150 Akron, New York 14001 Phone: 716-542-5435 <i>to widener addt'l \$2.00</i>	18.25	15.50	14.50	13.25	9.75	9.10
2018	17.00	15.00	14.00	13.00	9.50	8.75
Dolomite Products Company, Inc 1150 Penfield Road Rochester, New York 14625 Phone: 585-381-7010 or 585-943-7935 Gulf Rd. Leroy Plant <i>to widener addt'l N/B</i>	15.00	15.00	14.00	14.00	9.25	8.00
2018	14.00	14.50	13.00	13.00	9.00	7.75
Edward Hulme Inc 17 E. Buffalo St. Warsaw, New York 14569 Phone: 585-786-5880 <i>to widener addt'l \$0.50</i>	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	9.75	N/B
2018	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B
Hanson Aggregates GLSC, Inc. 6895 Ellicott Street Pavilion, New York 14525 Phone 584-3132 Stafford Plant <i>to widener addt'l \$3.00</i>	16.00	No Bid	14.00	14.00	9.00	8.25
2018	15.25	No Bid	13.50	13.50	8.50	8.00
New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co. 500 Como Park Blvd Buffalo, New York 14227 Phone: 716-826-7310 Wherle Drive, Lancaster Plant <i>to widener-No Bid</i>	20.00	No Bid	18.10	16.35	12.70	11.00
2018	19.40	No Bid	17.55	15.85	No Bid	No Bid

Todd Gadd
County Superintendent of Highways

Wyoming County Highway Dept
Rock Glen, NY

Crushed Stone

Crushed Stone - Bids opened March 19, 2019

Contract period 4/02/19 - 4/01/20

Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Arcade						2018
<u>Size</u>	<u>Price/Ton</u>	<u>Supplier</u>	<u>To Widener</u>	<u>Supplier</u>		
1A	22.25	Dolomite Products				County Line Stone 21.4
1st	20.05	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 19.4
1	19.05	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 18.4
2	17.80	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 17.4
Crusher Run 1	14.30	County Line Stone	16.30	County Line Stone		County Line Stone 13.9
Crusher Run 2	13.65	County Line Stone	15.65	County Line Stone		County Line Stone 13.15
Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Attica						
1A	18.25	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 17.25
1st	18.40	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 17.8
1	16.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 16
2	16.15	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 15.8
Crusher Run 1	12.25	Hanson Aggregates	14.65	County Line Stone		Hanson Aggregates 12
Crusher Run 2	11.50	Hanson Aggregates	14.00	County Line Stone		Hanson Aggregates 11.5
Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Bennington						
1A	19.25	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 18.7
1st	18.15	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 17.7
1	17.15	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 16.7
2	15.90	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 15.7
Crusher Run 1	12.40	County Line Stone	14.40	County Line Stone		County Line Stone 12.2
Crusher Run 2	11.75	County Line Stone	13.75	County Line Stone		County Line Stone 11.45
Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Castile						
1A	19.05	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 18.5
1st	19.05	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 19
1	18.55	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 17.5
2	18.55	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 17.5
Crusher Run 1	12.75	Ed Hulme Inc.	13.25	Ed Hulme Inc.		Dolomite Products 13.5
Crusher Run 2	12.55	Dolomite Products	16.25	Hanson Aggregates		Dolomite Products 12.25
Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Covington						
1A	17.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 16.75
1st	18.30	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 18.25
1	16.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 16
2	16.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 16
Crusher Run 1	12.50	Hanson Aggregates	13.90	Ed Hulme Inc.		Hanson Aggregates 11
Crusher Run 2	11.50	Hanson Aggregates	14.50	Hanson Aggregates		Hanson Aggregates 10.5

Wyoming County Highway Dept
Rock Glen, NY

Crushed Stone - Bids opened March 19, 2019

Crushed Stone

Contract period 4/02/19 - 4/01/20

Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Eagle

1A	22.20	Dolomite Products			Dolomite Products 21.6
1st	22.20	Dolomite Products			County Line Stone 21.9
1	21.50	Hanson Aggregates			Dolomite Products 20.6
2	20.35	County Line Stone			County Line Stone 19.9
Crusher Run 1	12.75	Ed Hulme Inc.	13.25	Ed Hulme Inc.	County Line Stone 16.4
Crusher Run 2	15.55	New Enterprise Stone	18.20	County Line Stone	Dolomite Products 15.35

**Ties awarded by Lot

Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Gainesville

<u>Size</u>		<u>Supplier</u>	<u>To Widener</u>	<u>Supplier</u>	2018
1A	18.75	Hanson Aggregates			Hanson Aggregates 18
1st	19.30	Dolomite Products			Dolomite Products 19.25
1	17.75	Hanson Aggregates			Hanson Aggregates 16.5
2	17.75	Hanson Aggregates			Hanson Aggregates 16.5
Crusher Run 1	11.95	Ed Hulme Inc.	12.45	Ed Hulme Inc.	Hanson Aggregates 12.5
Crusher Run 2	12.50	Hanson Aggregates	15.50	Hanson Aggregates	Hanson Aggregates 12

Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Genesee Falls

1A	19.65	Dolomite Products			Dolomite Products 19.1
1st	19.65	Dolomite Products			Dolomite Products 19.6
1	19.15	Dolomite Products			Dolomite Products 18.1
2	19.15	Dolomite Products			Dolomite Products 18.1
Crusher Run 1	12.75	Ed Hulme Inc.	13.25	Ed Hulme Inc.	Dolomite Products 14.1
Crusher Run 2	13.15	Dolomite Products	18.65	County Line Stone	Dolomite Products 12.35

Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Java

1A	21.15	Dolomite Products			Dolomite Products 20.55
1st	19.55	County Line Stone			County Line Stone 18.9
1	18.55	County Line Stone			County Line Stone 17.9
2	17.30	County Line Stone			County Line Stone 16.9
Crusher Run 1	12.85	Ed Hulme Inc.	13.35	Ed Hulme Inc.	County Line Stone 13.4
Crusher Run 2	13.15	County Line Stone	15.15	County Line Stone	County Line Stone 12.65

Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Middlebury

1A	17.75	Hanson Aggregates			Hanson Aggregates 16.75
1st	18.30	Dolomite Products			Dolomite Products 18.25
1	16.75	Hanson Aggregates			Hanson Aggregates 16
2	16.75	Hanson Aggregates			Hanson Aggregates 16
Crusher Run 1	12.50	Hanson Aggregates	13.25	Ed Hulme Inc.	Hanson Aggregates 11
Crusher Run 2	11.50	Hanson Aggregates	14.50	Hanson Aggregates	Hanson Aggregates 10.5

Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Orangeville

1A	18.50	Hanson Aggregates			Hanson Aggregates 17.75
1st	19.10	Dolomite Products			Dolomite Products 19.05
1	17.50	Hanson Aggregates			Hanson Aggregates 16
2	17.50	Hanson Aggregates			Hanson Aggregates 16
Crusher Run 1	11.55	Ed Hulme Inc.	12.05	Ed Hulme Inc.	Hanson Aggregates 12
Crusher Run 2	12.25	Hanson Aggregates	15.25	Hanson Aggregates	Hanson Aggregates 11.5

**Ties awarded by Lot

Wyoming County Highway Dept
Rock Glen, NY

Crushed Stone - Bids opened March 19, 2019

Crushed Stone

Contract period 4/02/19 - 4/01/20

Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Perry						2018
<u>Size</u>		<u>Supplier</u>	<u>To Widener</u>	<u>Supplier</u>		
1A	17.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 17.25
1st	18.35	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 18.3
1	16.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 16
2	16.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 16
Crusher Run 1	12.15	Ed Hulme Inc.	12.65	Ed Hulme Inc.		Hanson Aggregates 12
Crusher Run 2	11.50	Hanson Aggregates	14.50	Hanson Aggregates		Hanson Aggregates 11.5
Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Pike						
1A	19.65	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 19.1
1st	19.65	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 19.6
1	19.15	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 18.1
2	19.15	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 18.1
Crusher Run 1	12.85	Ed Hulme Inc.	13.35	Ed Hulme Inc.		Dolomite Products 14.1
Crusher Run 2	13.15	Dolomite Products	18.65	County Line Stone		Dolomite Products 12.85
Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Sheldon						
1A	21.00	Hanson Aggregates				County Line Stone / hanson 20.
1st	19.10	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 18.5
1	18.10	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 17.5
2	16.85	County Line Stone				County Line Stone 16.5
Crusher Run 1	12.85	Ed Hulme Inc.	13.35	Ed Hulme Inc.		County Line Stone 13
Crusher Run 2	12.70	County Line Stone	14.70	County Line Stone		County Line Stone 12.25
Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Warsaw						
1A	17.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 17
1st	18.40	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 18.35
1	16.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 16
2	16.75	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 16
Crusher Run 1	11.55	Ed Hulme Inc.	12.05	Ed Hulme Inc.		Hanson Aggregates 11
Crusher Run 2	11.50	Hanson Aggregates	14.50	Hansen Aggregates		Hanson Aggregates 10.5
Bid price/ton delivered to any location in the Town of Wethersfield						
1A	19.25	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 18.5
1st	19.90	Dolomite Products				Dolomite Products 19.8
1	18.25	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 17
2	18.25	Hanson Aggregates				Hanson Aggregates 17
Crusher Run 1	11.55	Ed Hulme Inc.	12.05	Ed Hulme Inc.		Hanson Aggregates 13
Crusher Run 2	13.00	Hanson Aggregates	16.00	Hanson Aggregates		Hanson Aggregates 12.5

**Ties awarded by Lot